Mindoro State University Suksimuedis omess

Victoria, Oriental Mindoro 5205 Philippines Mobile: +63 977 846 72 28

BAGONG PILIPINAS

SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF OFFICE EQUIPMENT AND OTHER SUPPLIES FOR THE CTE DEPARTMENT OF
MinSU CALAPAN CITY CAMPUS
Name of Project

BAC Resolution Recommending Approval
Resolution No. 69, s. 2024

WHEREAS, the Mindoro State University (MinSU), through the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC) has
advertised in the PhilGEPS and MinSU Website the Request for Quotation (RFQ) for the project “Supply and Delivery
of Office Equipment and Other Supplies for the CTE Department of MinSU Calapan City Campus” with an Approved
Budget for the Contract (ABC) amounting to Two Hundred Fifty-Three Thousand Six Hundred Seventy-Five Pesos
{Php253,675.00) with two lots namely;

Particulars Sub-ABC Amount
Lot 1- Office Equipment Php245,000.00
Lot 2- Other Supplies Php8,675.00

WHEREAS, in response to the said advertisement, seven (7) suppliers were found in the document request list,
and six (6) suppliers in the name of LUXENBERG MARKETING, INC., PELAGO APPLIANCES, MKRJ MARKETING,
IRAYA LIFE ENTERPRISES, DUPLICAT NON-SPECIALIZED WHOLESALE TRADING and LB2 LABORATORY
SUPPLIES submitted price quotation before the deadline;

WHEREAS, LUXENBERG MARKETING, INC. submitted price quotation for Lot 1; while PELAGO
APPLIANCES, MKRJ MARKETING, IRAYA LIFE ENTERPRISES, DUPLICAT NON-SPECIALIZED WHOLESALE
TRADING and LB2 LABORATORY SUPPLIES submitted price quotations for Lots 1 and 2;

WHEREAS, the detailed evaluation of price quotation resulted in the following:

LakHo: ‘i‘:“;’g‘::"t':;d{fé g)’r Name of Bidder Price Quotation
Luxenberg Marketing, Inc. Php132,500.00
Pelago Appliances Php175,000.00
Iraya Life Enterprises Php225,930.00
Lot 1- Office Equipment Php245,000.00 Duplicat Non-Specialized Php232,310.00
Wholesale Trading
MKRJ Marketing Php237,000.00
LB2 Laboratory Supplies Php377,750.00
Pelago Appliances Php10,650.00
Iraya Life Enterprises Php12,618.00
Lot 2- Other Supplies Php8,675.00 D”mﬁ:’s‘;ﬁsﬁzﬁiﬂgﬁd Rt 52000
MKRJ Marketing Php15,200.00
LB2 Laboratory Supplies Php26,290.00

WHEREAS, the BAC examined and verified the price quotations submitted by the abovementioned suppliers
and was found to be complying and responsive; thus, the Lot 1 of this project be awarded to the supplier in the name of
LUXENBERG MARKETING, INC. with the Lowest Calculated Responsive Bid (LCRB);

WHEREAS, upon evaluation of the price quotations submitted by the suppliers who submitted for lot 2, they all
exceeded the Approved Budget for the contract and is automatically disqualified; therefore, the BAC opted to published
the Lot 2 of this project for the second time in the PhilGEPS and MinSU Website and other conspicuous place;
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Mindoro State University 5 wivsprsient@nim.aiuzh

Victoria, Oriental Mindoro 5205 Philippines Mobile: +63 977 846 72 28

BAGONG PILIPINAS

NOW, THEREFORE, the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC) HEREBY RESOLVED AS IT IS HEREBY
RESOLVED, recommended to the Head of Procuring Entity the approval of this resolution for the abovementioned
procurement awarding of contract for the “Supply and Delivery of Office Equipment and Other Supplies for the CTE
Department of MinSU Calapan City Campus” to LUXENBERG MARKETING, INC. amounting to One Hundred Thirty-
Two Thousand Five Hundred Pesos (Php132,500.00) with official address at #8 San Antonio Ave., San Antonio Valley
1, Parafiaque City as the supplier/bidder with the Lowest Calculated Responsive Bid (LCRB) for Lot 1;

RESOLVED, at MinSU Main Campus, te, Victoria) Oriental Mindoro, this 15" day of April, 2024.

10 H. DAVALQS, Ph.D.

BAC Chairperson
ELVI €. ESCAREZ, Ph.D.
BACMember
CIEDELEE’%R Ph.D MELGAR G. FADRIQUELAN
BAC Member BAC Memper
Approved/Disapprove:

Rroa
CHRISTIAN ANTHONY C.JAGUTAYA Ph.D.

OIC, Office of the University President
Date:
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4/15/24, 9:25 AM printableBidNoticeAbstract

it

Philippine Government Electronic Procurement System

Bid Notice Abstract
Request for Quotation (RFQ)

Reference Number 10728582
Procuring Entity MINDORO STATE UNIVERSITY

Title Supply and Delivery of Office Equipment and Other Supplies for the CTE Department of MinSU

Calapan City Campus
Area of Delivery Oriental Mindoro Y W LhSELS e e
St

Solicitation Number: RFQ No. 2024-64

Trade Agreement: Implementing Rules and
Regulations | | l/ﬂ o }Cif m A 7D

¢ 1

Procurement Mode: Negotiated Procurement -

Small Value Procurement

(Sec. 53.9)
Classification: Goods )El LG I 7/ g;b ,ﬂ’ 0
Category: Appliances
Approved Budget for pyp 253,675.00 = —
the Contract:
Delivery Period: 30 Day/s
Client Agency: 5 5024
Contact Person: MARK LESTER A MAGPANTAY |

Head, BAC Secretariat Last Updated / Time 05/04/2024 00:00 AM

Alcate

Victoria

Oriental Mindoro

Philippines 5205 Closing Date / Time 12/04/2024 17:00 PM

63-9-154612960

macmagpantay@minsu.edu.ph

Description

in the address stated in the last page.
NEMESIO H. DAVALOS, Ph.D.

BAC Chairperson

Note: 1. All entries must be typewritten.

2. Delivery Period within ___ calendar days.

of acceptance by the procuring entity.
4. Price validity shall be a period of 30 calendar days.
5. G-EPS Registration Certificate shall be attached upon submission of the Quotation.

7. Mode of delivery: [ ] Pick-up (Schedule) [ ] Door to Door Delivery

Item No. Unit ITEM AND DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT
Lot 1- Office Equipment

1 unit 50" Smart TV with wall bracket 5
4K (3,840x2,160) Resolution

120Hz (Up to 144Hz) Refresh Rate

HDR with Al Upscale

with USB, HDMI and Ethernet Connectivity
Lot 2- Other Supplies

1 pcs Pail 4

2 pcs Dipper 5

3 pack All-purpose Cleaner 900ml 10

https:finotices.phi!geps.gov.phlGEPSNONPILOTrrenderlPrintableBidNoticeAbstractUI.aspx‘?reﬁd=1 0728582

Please quote your lowest price on the items / listed below, subject to the General Condition on the last page, stating
the shortest time of delivery and submit your quotation duly signed by your representative not later than

3. Warranty shall be for a period of six (6) months for supplies and materials, one (1) year for Equipment, from date

6. Bidders shall submit Original Brochures showing certification of the product being offered (optional).

1/2



4/15/24, 9:25 AM printableBidNoticeAbstract
4 bott;e Bleach 1 Gallon &
5 pcs Soft-broom 12
6 pcs Dust apn 10
7 pcs Scrubbing Brush 3
8 bottle Fabric Conditioner 670ml 3

XVXVXVX\D(VXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVX

Created by Annabelle Quinto Madrigal
Date Created 04/04/2024

hical errors or misinformation presented in the system. PhilGEPS

The PhilGEPS team is not responsible for any typograp
d any queries regarding the postings should be directed to the

only displays information provided for by its clients, an
contact person/s of the concerned party.

© 2004-2024 DBM Procurement Service. All rights reserved. Help | Contact Us | Sitemap

https:/fnoﬁces.philgeps.gov.phIGEPSNONPILOTIT ender/PrintableBidNoticeAbstractUl.aspx?refid=10728582



Mindoro State University bmi ey gminsudurn

Victoria, Oriental Mindoro 5205 Philippines Mobile: +63 977 846 72 28

BAGONG PILIPINAS

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

Supply and Delivery of Office Equipment and Other Supplies for the CTE Department of MinSU Calapan City Campus
PR No.: 2024-005

RFQ No. 2024-64
ABC Amount: Php253,675.00
Company Name  : LUXENBERG MARKETING INC.
Address : 2/F#10 GOVERNOR PASCUAL AVE. ACACIA MALABON CITY
Please quote your lowest price on the items / listed below, subject to the General Condition on the last page, stating the shortest time of

delivery and submit your quotation duly signed by your representative not later than in the address stated in the last page.
NEMESIO H. DAVALQS, Ph.D.
BAC Chairperson

Note: 1. All entries must be typewritten.
2. Delivery Period within ___calendar days.
3. Warranty shall be for a period of six (6) months for supplies and materials, one (1) year for Equipment, from date
of acceptance by the procuring entity.
4. Price validity shall be a period of 30 calendar days.
5. G-EPS Registration Certificate shall be attached upon submission of the Quotation.
6. Bidders shall submit Original Brochures showing certification of the product being offered (optional).
7. Mode of delivery: [ ]Pick-up (Schedule) [ ]Door to Door Delivery

Item ; UNIT
No. Unit ITEM AND DESCRIPTION QTy. PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT

Lot 1- Office Equipment :
1 unit | 50" Smart TV with wall bracket 5 2650000 132.500.00 |/
4K (3,840x2,160) Resolution

120Hz (Up to 144Hz) Refresh Rate

HDR with Al Upscale

with USB, HDMI and Ethernet Connectivity
Lot 2- Other Supplies

1 pcs Pail 4 NO BID
2 pcs Dipper 5 NO BID
3 pack All-purpose Cleaner 900ml| 10 NO BID
4 bott;e Bleach 1 Gallon 6 NO BID
5 pcs Soft-broom 12 NO BID
6 pcs Dust apn 10 NO BID
7 pcs Scrubbing Brush 3 NO BID
8 bottle Fabric Conditioner 670ml 3 NO BID
XVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVX
| TOTAL 132.500.00

After having carefully read and accepted your General Condition, | / We quate you on the item at prices noted above })g y
RUDERICK R. OCHIA
Supplier’s Signature over Printed Name
007-281-234-000
TIN No. of Establishment
09395688697
Contact Number
APRIL 12, 2024
Date

MSU-BAC-FR-05.01

«Main Campus, Aleate, Victoria  Bongabong Campus, Labasan, Bongabong «Calapan City Campus, Masipit, Calapan City




ITEM CODE
MODEL: 50SUE6800

LuXe

marl

TO: MINDORO STATE UNIVERSITY
LESTER A. MAGPANTAY
HEAD, BAC SECRETARIAT
ALCATE
VICTORIA
ORIENTAL MINDORO

DESCRIPTION
BRAND: SKYWORTH

Description
Skyworth 50SUE6800

50SUEGB00

3840 x 2160 (UHD)

4K Google TV

IPS Panel

Eye Care TV
Antibacterial Remote
Dolby Audio
Chameleon Extreme 2.0
Boundless Screen
Game Mode

Pure HDRIO & HLG



.ﬁ PELAGO

APPLIANCES

PRICE QUOTATION

ADDRESS: QUOTE NO: KB1011
Room 501 #210 Speaker Perez St. DATE : April 12, 2024
Barangay Maharlika, District 1, Quezon City VALID DATE : May 12, 2024
QUOTE TO: TIN : 748-881-671-000
MARK LESTER A MAGPANTAY MAYOR'S NO.: 21-007669
Head, BAC Secretariat DTINO.: 3015878
Alcate PHILGEPS NO : 317769
Victoria
Oriental Mindoro
item Description Unit Quantity Unit price Total Price |
55" Crystal UHD AU7002 4K Smart TV 5 £35,000.00 £175,000.00 |
Orocan Pail Balde Timba Tabo Heavy Duty 10 12 16 24 liters 10L 12L 16L 24L - C 4 £300.00 £1,200.00
Orocan & High Quality very thick and sturdy Dipper | Tabo 9971R L) £60.00 £300.00
Ajax Lavender Fresh Antibacterial Multipurpose Cleaner Kills 99.9% of Bacteria 1 10 £250.00 $2,500.00
Zonrox Bleach Original Gallon, Zonrox Bleach ColorSafe Gallon (3600ml) 6 $300.00 £1,800.00
Walis Tambo/ Rattan made Soft brooms 12 £250.00 $3,000.00
Plastic Dustpan Detachable Handle 10 £80.00 £800.00
Floor Scrub Brush Stiff Bristles Stainless Steel Long Handle 3 £150.00 £450.00
Surf Fabric Conditioner Blossom Fresh 670ml 3 #200.00 ©600.00 A
»
Terms and Conditions : Sub Total P185,650.00
1. Delivery is expected to arrive within 10-15 days upon issuance of a Tax Rate (12%) $22,278.00
Purchasing Order.
Discount £0.00
2. Any request for changes to the quotation should be directed to the authorized
personnel of Pelago Appliances Co.
GRAND TOTAL P185,650.00
By accepting the quotation, the client agrees to be bound by the terms and conditions outlined in the quotation and any accompanying agreements or contracts.
We look forward to be of service to your company. For orders, please contact our office or the following information below.
Prepared by: Approved by: Conforme by:
KING BHERWYN A. DELA TORRE
Sales Staff EDMUND T.DANAO Signature with Printed Name
0917 114 9622 Sales and Training Officer
‘ ) . i
¢ 1{}:; v ot Ve

WE APPRECIATE YOUR VALUED BUSINESS!




Mindoro State University 5 wiveivpresident@minsu.cduph

Victoria, Oriental Mindoro 5205 Philippines Mobile: +63 977 846 72 28
BACGONG PILIPINAS
REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Supply and Delivery of Office Equipment and Other Supplies for the CTE Department of MinSU Calapan City Campus
PR No.: 2024-005
RFQ No. 2024-64

ABC Amount: Php253,675.00
Company Name : MKRJ MARKETING
Address : San Agustin 1, Naujan, Oriental Mindoro .

Please quote your lowest price on the items / listed below, subject to the General Condition on the last ing the shortest time of
delivery and submit your quotation duly signed by your representative not later than in theladdresy/stated_in the last page.
NEMESIQ H. DAVALOS, Ph.D.
BA7Chairperson

Note: 1. All entries must be typewritten. |

2. Delivery Period within ____calendar days.

3. Warranty shall be for a period of six (6) months for supplies and materials, one (1) year for Equipment, from date
of acceptance by the procuring entity.

4. Price validity shall be a period of 30 calendar days.

5. G-EPS Registration Certificate shall be attached upon submission of the Quotation.

6. Bidders shall submit Original Brochures showing certification of the product being offered (optional).

7. Mode of delivery: [ ] Pick-up (Schedule) [ ] Door to Door Delivery

ltem UNIT
No. Unit ITEM AND DESCRIPTION QTy. PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT

Lot 1- Office Equipment
1 unit 50" Smart TV with wall bracket 5 47,400.00 |  237,000.00
4K (3,840x2,160) Resolution

120Hz (Up to 144Hz) Refresh Rate

HDR with Al Upscale

with USB, HDMI and Ethernet Connectivity
Lot 2- Other Supplies

1 pcs Pail 4 450.00 1,800.00

2 pcs Dipper 5 200.00 1,000.00

3 pack All-purpose Cleaner 900ml 10 300.00 3,000.00

4 bottle Bleach 1 Gallon 6 300.00 1,800.00

5 pcs Soft-broom 12 300.00 3,600.00

6 pcs Dust pan 10 250.00 2,500.00

7/ pcs Scrubbing Brush 3 250.00 750.00 —
8 bottle | Fabric Conditioner 670ml 3 250.00 750.00 ,&}f:’ b

XVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVIVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVIVX X
| TOTAL Php 252,200.00

After having carefully read and accepted your General Condition, | / We quote you on the item at prices noted above W
MAMNCEL K. R

Supplier’s Signature over Printed Name
299-108-912-000

TIN No. of Establishment
09369516747

Contact Number
04-\2 - 1024
Date

MSU-BAC-FR-05.01

*Main Campus, Alcate, Victoria +Bongabong Campus, Labasan, Bongabong +Calapan City Campus, Masipit, Calapan City



Mindore State Universily i mivsipesidotamim.oinph

Victoria, Oriental Mindoro 5205 Philippines Mobile: +63 977 846 72 28

BAGONG PILIPINAS

General Conditions

1. Quotations and other requirements stated below shall be submitted to the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC) Office, Mindoro State University
-Main Campus, Alcate, Victoria, Oriental Mindoro, Philippines on the date and time stated in this RFP.
2. Supplier shall submit the following requirements:
Duly signed original copy of Request for Quotation (RFQ). Prices shall be quoted in Philippine Pesos.
PhilGEPS Registration
Valid Mayor’s/Business Permit
Omnibus Sworn Statement
BIR Certificate of Registration
Latest Income/Business Tax Return
TAX Clearance
DTI Registration/SEC Certificate
i. Original Brochures or certificates of the items offered showing its performance characteristics or specifications, if applicable
Price validity shall be 30 calendar days from the deadline of submission of quotation.
Ocular Inspection

TP o0 oW

Upon the decision of the End-User and BAC, the supplier and its concerned premises may be subjected to ocular inspection and approval by the
End-User and/or TWG Inspections of the BAC prior to the award.
Award

The supplier that submitted the lowest calculated responsive quotation, and passed the inspection conducted by the End-User and BAC prior to
the event, if any, shall be awarded the contract.
Evaluation of Quotations

Quotations shall be compared and evaluated of the basis of the following criteria:
1. Completeness of Submission
2. Compliance with Iltem & Description Requirements
3. Price
Instructions

1. Supplier shall be responsible for the source(s) of its goods/services/equipment, and which shall be in accordance with the schedule
and specifications of the RFQ or contract. Failure of the supplier to comply with this provision shall be ground for cancellation of the
award or purchase order issued to the supplier.

2. Supplier that accepted an award, purchase order, or contract but failed to deliver the required goods/services/equipment within the
time called for in the award, purchase order, or contract shall be disqualified from participating in MinSU or any of MinSU campuses
future procurement activities. This is without prejudice to the imposition of other sanctions prescribed under R.A. 9184 and its IRR-A
against the supplier.

3.  Allduties, excise, and other taxes and revenue charges shall be paid by the supplier.

4.  All transactions are subject to withholding of credible Government Taxes per revenue regulation(s) of the Bureau of Internal Revenue

Liquidation Damages

A penalty of one-tenth of one percent (0.001) of the total value of the undelivered goods/services/equipment shall be charged as liquidated
damages for every day of delay of the delivery of the purchased goods/services/equipment.

Warranty
Supplier warrants that all goods/services/equipment to be provided are of acceptable industry standard.

Payment

Payment shall be made only upon a certification by the Head of the Procuring Entity to the effect that the GOODS have been rendered or
delivered in accordance with the terms of this Contract and have been duly inspected and accepted.

MSU-BAC-FR-05.01

«Main Campus, Alcate, Victoria »Bongabong Campus, Labasan, Bongabong +Calapan City Campus, Masipit, Calapan City




Company Name
Address

Mlndoro State University

Victoria, Oriental Mindoro 5205 Philippines

Email: universitypresidenl@minsu.edu.ph
Website: www.minsu.edu.ph

Mobile: +67 977 846 72 28

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

Supply and Delivery of Office Equipment and Other Supplies for the CTE Department of MinSU Calapan City Campus
PR No.: 2024-005

G YA LITE ENTERPRISES

BUMSAN CALa PAN TV

Please quote your lowest price on the items / listed below, subject to the General Condition on
delivery and submit your quotation duly signed by your representative not later than

RFQ No.

2024-64

ABC Amount: Php253,675.00

.| BAC Chairprson

stating the shortest time of
8 stated in the last page.

Note: 1. All entries must be typewritten.
2. Delivery Period within ___calendar days.
3. Warranty shall be for a period of six (6) months for supplles and materials, one (1) year for Equipment, from date
of acceptance by the procuring entity.
4. Price validity shall be 3 period of 30 calendar days.
5. G-EPS Registration Certificate shall be attached upon submission of the Quotation.
6. Bidders shall submit Original Brochures showing certification of the product being offered (optional].
7. Mode of delivery: [ ] Pick-up (Schedule) [ ] Door to Door Delivery
oy Unit ITEM AND DESCRIPTION ary. | YN | TOTAL AMOUNT
Lot 1- Office Equipment
1 unit 50" Smart TV with wall bracket 5 4C 4o+ 23S, 9%0 —
4K (3,840x2,160) Resolution
120Hz (Up to 144Hz) Refresh Rate
HDR with Al Upscale
with USB, HDMI and Ethernet Connectivity
Lot 2- Other Supplies
3 pcs Pail 4 Ns - LOGD- «
2 pcs Dipper 5 254) e I Yoo - 7
3 pack All-purpose Cleaner 900ml 10 9.1 - /
4 bott;e | Bleach 1 Gallon 6 1200~ | J,A00-
5 pcs Soft-broom 12 Alo— 2S00~
6 pcs Dust apn 10 [ 2, 1%-
7 pcs Scrubbing Brush 3 12% < 299 -
8 bottle | Fabric Conditioner 670ml 3 1§3. £7- v UIEF
[TOTAL - D HE| X
After having carefully read and accepted your General Condition, | / We quote you on the item at prices noted above
Mama JooRRy €. MENDIZ4
Supplier’s Sig’nature over Printed Name
[0 - 38 - OO0
TIN No. of Establishment
O9TIR0Y 1325
Contact Number
OY-12-202¥
Date
MSU-BAC-FR-05.01
=Main Campus, Alcate, Victoria  +Bongabong Campus, Labasan, Bongabong  «Calapan City Campus, Masipit, Calapan City



Mindoro State University Zm:universiypresident@mine.cduph

Victoria, Oriental Mindoro 5205 Philippines Mobile: +63 977 846 72 28

BAGONG PILIPINAS

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

Supply and Delivery of Office Equipment and Other Supplies for the CTE Department of MinSU Calapan City Campus
PR No.: 2024-005
RFQ No. 2024-64

ABC Amount: Php253,675.00
CompanyName : DUPLICAT NON-SPECIALIZED WHOLESALE TRADING

Address -  STO. NINO CALAPAN CITY

Please quote your lowest price on the items / listed below, subject to the General Condition on the/last page,

ating the shortest time of

delivery and submit your quotation duly signed by your representative not later than ge.
S10 H. DAVALQS, Ph.D.
BAC Chairperson
Note: 1. All entries must be typewritten.
2. Delivery Period within ___calendar days.
3. Warranty shall be for a period of six (6) months for supplies and materials, one (1) year for Equipment, from dat
of acceptance by the procuring entity.
4. Price validity shall be a period of 30 calendar days.
5. G-EPS Registration Certificate shall be attached upon submission of the Quotation.
6. Bidders shall submit Original Broch howing certification of the product being offered (optional).
7. Mode of delivery: [ ] Pick-up (Schedule) [ ] Door to Door Delivery
UNIT
fem ITEM AND DESCRIPTION Qry. TOTAL AMOUNT
No. PRICE
’ Lot 1- Office Equipment
1 unit |50" Smart TV with wall bracket 5 46,462.00 232,310.004
4K (3,840x2,160) Resolution
120Hz (Up to 144Hz) Refresh Rate
HDR with Al Upscale
with USB, HDMI and Ethernet Connectivity
Lot 2- Other Supplies
1 pcs |Pail 4 170.00 680.00
2 pcs |Dipper 5 154.00 770.00
3 pack |All-purpose Cleaner 900ml 10 308.00 3,080.00
4 bott;e |Bleach 1 Gallon 6 225.00 1,350.00
5 pcs  |Soft-broom 12 316.00 3,792.00
6 pcs |Dustapn 10 270.00 2,700.00
74 pcs  [Scrubbing Brush 3 85.00 255.00 :
8 | bottle |Fabric Conditioner 670m! 3 231.00 693.00 | 5 3%
XVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVVXVXVX ‘
TOTAL 245,630.00

After having carefully read and accepted your General Condition, | / We quote you on the item at prices noted above m’
STEPHEN MAGBANUA

Supplier’s Signature over Printed Name

262-488-795-000

TIN No. of Establishment
0927-4283705

Contact Number

04-12-2024

Date

MSU-BAC-FR-05.01

«Main Campus, Alcate, Victoria  *Bongabong Campus, Labasan, Bongabong  +Calapan City Campus, Masipit, Calapan City




Mindoro State University & mivesiypresdent@minsu.cduph

Victoria, Oriental Mindoro 5205 Philippines Mobile: +63 977 846 72 28

BAGONG PILIPINAS

REQUEST FOR QUOTATION
Supply and Delivery of Office Equipment and Other Supplies for the CTE Department of MinSU Calapan City Campus
PR No.: 2024-005
RFQ No. 2024-64

ABC Amount: Php253,675.00
LB2 LABORATORY SUPPLIES

Company Name
Address : #BSAN ANTONIO AVE, SAN ANTONIO VALLEY 1 PARANAQUE CITY

Please quote your lowest price on the items / listed below, subject to the General Condition onhw
delivery and submit your quotation duly signed by your representative not later than i

stating the shortest time of
ss stated in the last page.

NE|

BAC Chairperson

Note: 1. All entries must be typewritten.

2. Delivery Period within__30_calendar days.
3. Warranty shall be for a period of six (6) months for supplies and materials, one (1) year for Equipment, from date
of acceptance by the procuring entity.

4. Price validity shall be a period of 30 calendar days.

5. G-EPS Registration Certificate shall be attached upon submission of the Quotation.

6. Bidders shall submit Original Brochures showing certification of the product being offered (optional).

7. Mode of delivery: [ ] Pick-up (Schedule) [ ]Door to Door Delivery

Item A UNIT
No. Unit ITEM AND DESCRIPTION QTy. PRICE TOTAL AMOUNT

Lot 1- Office Equipment
1 unit | 50" Smart TV with wall bracket ‘msse ouramacoorrer| 5 75550 | 75550 - 377 (KD
4K (3,840x2,160) Resolution

120Hz (Up to 144Hz) Refresh Rate

HDR with Al Upscale

with USB, HDMI and Ethernet Connectivity

Lot 2- Other Supplies
1 pcs Pail “PLS SEE OUR ATTACHED OFFER 4 450 1,800
2 pcs Dipper *PLS SEE OUR ATTACHED OFFER 5 180 900
3 pack All-purpose Cleaner 900ml *pis see our aTTAcHEDOFFer| 10 750 7,500
4 bott;e Bleach 1 Gallon *PLS SEE OUR ATTACHED OFFER 6 800 4,800
5 pcs Soft-broom *PLSSEE OUR ATTACHED OFFER 12 450 5,400
6 pcs Dust apn e CLRTACHED OFFER] 10 250 2,500 4D
7 pcs Scrubbing Brush LS SEE OURATIACHED OFEER 3 280 840 U '
8 bottle Fabric Conditioner 670ml *PLS SEE OUR ATTACHED OFFER 3 850 2,550
XVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVXVX ]
| TOTAL 101,840, "
[ L‘.’F 7 1 ‘-ﬁ-._f:;} )

Supplier’s Signature over Printed Name
282-321-992-000
TIN No. of Establishment
(02)71190556 / 09171007761/09171232848
Contact Number
APRIL 11,2024
Date

After having carefully read and accepted your General Condition, 1 / We quote you on the item at prices noted above
CAMELLE F. CASUELA

MSU-BAC-FR-05.01

*Main Campus, Alcate, Victoria  <Bongabong Campus, Labasan, Bongabong «Calapan City Campus, Masipit, Calapan City
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Republic of the Philippines
Department of Budget and Management
PROCUREMENT SERVICE
CERTIFICATE OF PHILGEPS REGISTRATION

Platinum Membership)

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT

LUXENBERG MARKETING, INC.
[0 GOV PASCUAL AVE ACACIA ST,
Malabon Ciry . Merro Mamila . NCR | Philippines

is regisicred in the Philippine Government Electronic Procurement System (PhilGEPS) on 03-dug-2021
pursuant fo Section 8.35.2 of the Revised Implementing Rules and Regulations of Republic Act No. 9IS,
otherwize known ax the Government Procuremen: Reform Act

This further certifies thar LUXENBERG MARKETING, INC. has subnutted the reguired eligibility documents
in the PRIGEPS Sugplier Registry ax listed in Annex A, which document is attached hereto and made an integral
parr hereaf.

For the purpose of updating this Cernficate, all Class “A" eligibiity documents covered by Section 8.5.2 of the
Revised Implementing Rules and Regulations of Republic Act No. 9184 supporting the veracity. authenticicy and
validiy of this Certificate shall remam current and updated. The failiire by the prospective Bidder to update this
Certificate with the current and updated Class "A 7 eligibity documents shall result in the automatic suspension
of its validiny unnl such time that all of the expired Class “A " eligibility documents has been updated

By submutting this Certificate, the Bidder certifies:

—

. the authenticity, gemuineness, validity, and completeness of the copy of the original eligibility documents
submurted;

[&¥]

. the veracity of the statements and information comarned therein;

ey

_ that the Certificate is not @ guaranty that the named registrant will be declared eligible withour first
being determined to be such for that particular brdding, nor is 1t an evidence that the Bidder hay passed
the post-qualificarion stage, and

4 that any finding of concealment, falsification, or misrepresentation of any of the eligibility documents

submitted. or the contents thereof shall be a ground for disqualification from furtker participation in the

bidding process, without prejudice to the imposition of apprapriate administrazive. cnvil and eriminal
penalty in accordance with the laws.

Thix Certificare is valid until J4-Sep-2024
Issued this 20th day of Scptember 2023

This is a system generated certificate. No signature is required

Documentary Stamp Tax Paid Php 30.00
Certificate Reference No: 202108265854378100998 Pugetad




REMINDERS '

s The PRilGEPS office shall not determine the eligibility of merchants. The PRilGEPS office 's evaluation
of the eligibility reguirements shall be for the sole purpose of deternuning the approval or disapproval
of the merchant's application for registration.

® 4 merchant’s registration ond memberskip in the GOP-OMR s neither comtract-specific nor
undersiood to be tantamount to a finding of eligibility. Neither shall the merchant’s successful
registration in the GOP-OMR be relied upon to claim eligibility tor the purpese of pariicipation in gny
public bidding.

o The determination of the eigibility of merchants, whether registered with the GOP-OMR or not. shall
remain with the Bids and Awards Committee (BAC). The BAC's determination of validity of the
eligibilitv requirements shall be conclusive w enable the merchant to participate in the public bidding
process.

Certificate Reference No: 202 10826589437810099%
Page 20 3

‘Refer 1o Section 4 ol the Guidelines for the Liss of the {overnmens of the Prulippines - Officss) Merchant's Registry




"Annex A"

List of Eligibility Documents

of

LUXENBERG MARKETING. INC.

10 GOV PASCUAL AVE ACACIA ST,

Malaban City . Metro Manila . NCR . Philippmes

SEC Certificate

Registration Date © 16-Apr-2009
SEC Cemificate Number : CS200903443

Mavors Permit

t
{1ssued By / Signatory - Mr Russel G. Besabe / Hon. Jeanie N Sandoval

Expiration Date : 31-Dec-2023
Permit Number : 2023 0005789
Place of Issue : Ciry of Malabon

Issuance Date @ 26-Jan-2023

Tax Clearance

Expiration Date : 14-Nov-2023
TCC Number - RR5-026-11-14-R1315-2022-M
Issued By / Signatory - Luisa M. Labad

Issuance date © 14-Nov-2022

Audited Financiual Statement

Date of Filing : 17-Apr-2023
Current Asset © 90,626,997 00
Total Asset: 94.265,307.00
Current Lizbilitics : 47.292,720.00
Total Liabilitics : 61,892,720.00
Name of Auditor - Ma. Paz D. Ingal
BIR RDO Code : 026

PCAR License

Expiration Date : -

Issued By / Signatory -
Issuance Date : -

License Number :

Licensc First issue Dage -
Principal Classification
Cartegory :

Centificate Reference No: 2021082658943 781 00998

Page 30l 3




BUSINESS ACCOUNT NUMBER

MALABON
. o _14-002267 :
T MAYOR'S PLRMIT NUMBER ;
CITY OF MALABON SoYNE Tl
BUSINESS PERMIT AND LICENSING OFFICE 2t sutusI:"‘:
RENEWAL
NAME OF OWNER LUXENBERG "m'_(_ETTG' INC.,
BUSINESS NAME LUXENBERG MARKETING, INC. i ) |
T S T |
ADDRESS UNIT A-18 { FORMERLY A14 } 202, GOV. PASCUAL AVE.,, j ‘

, NT
DATE OF ISSUE | gin7r2024 | AREA [ 5772 | EMPLOYEES [0 ]

LINE OF BUSINESS: WHOLESALER - DEALER

AMOUNT PAID: 393.053.23 OR NO.: 22523743 DATE PAID:  0U37/2024
REMARKS:
e e 4 -
;17;-—’# N
HON. JEANNIE N. SANDOVAL MR. RUSSELL G. BESABE
CITY MAYOR OIC-BPLO

SJCJLCT FORINIACITON DISPLAYINA CONSPICUQUS PLACE AT BUSINESS ESTASLISHMENT. NOT ¥ALIO WITHOUT OF FICIAL BECELIRT
(Fras PERMIT WILL EXPRLON faaume )



BIR

REPUBLIKANGPILIPINAS
KAGAWARAN NG PANANALAPI
KAWANIHAN NG RENTAS INTERRAS
REVENLEREGION NO 26

REVENUE DISTRICT NO,

Form No. 2 3 0 3

Revised July 1997

4RCO0002127€2
OCN

JANTUS5Z2016

CERTIFICATE OF REGISTRATION

TIN NAME REGISTRATION DATE
007-281-234-000 LUKENBERG MARKETING, TINC. 05/25/200%
REGISTERED ADDRESS eyt FLJ OUV raolUdal, AV
g ACRCIA
MATABON CITYTI
REG IST%%)%‘;&\-’!TY( 1E=S)
INCOME TAX REGISTRATION E&E
VALUE = RDDED TAX WITHEHQLOING TAX - COMPENSATION
WITHHOLDING ThAX - EXPANDED/OTH

REMINDERS:

TRADE NAME ZINE
LUXENBERG MARKETING, INC. 5139 W
G

!
I
i
]
|
!
!
f

TRY

S5aLE- O OTHER HOUSEHOLD

PG 08 RIQUMID TAN RETEMN SO COMISCIAS VAT T SOV TAX TYPTS WITH OF WITOGT SPTRATON PO AVOVD Al NET

WITHN T DAYS ERCAP SEGETRATON DATE T FOU0WNG Sa0utl ot
INCOME TAX WITHHGUDONG TAR - CPANDID A COATIIET:

R sniis ewowmtacn ConpdPant/A550C IGGLE  IGTH Day of the loloming eom® Bave o alciumm
Df o0 17020 1E0SE Annual iwfarmation Raturs Sarch 1 Aamcasts w0 evw VAR
Ofis7 cuwter | 2pr15 {17 Quaner | Mav-i0 SINGLE PROPRIETOR

Ird Quanmer | Aug-18 |Indqusner | Aug-29 W THNOLTANG TAX - COMPENSATION RENTVAAL OF ANNUAL AEGHTRATION FLE % OR B2FCRE Lanuary 11 USING
O 1305 Quanms Now-15 {10 Quarter Nov-29 11561 | 107w cay ol tte folcwing month R
2 170 Apr-15 1702 Aor-15 | 1604 CF - Arecal informanan feturn - lasusey 31
6 VAT |

25500 - 20th day of the taliowing month PERCENTAGE TAX

A DIATILT MDA Th% LS TAK T DRGICH I CALE G TRANTF AT ESSATI M OF
23500 every I5th day after the doe of suc toarter 255188 - 20th Sy of the fnliowiry monath EEGATAANCH FAD OTRUA LONTUNNG BY LG FDAM 1603

INDICATED ABOVE. UNDE
REVENUE CODE, AS AME,

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT T

"FHE
DL

HEWBOVE NAMED PERSON 5 REGISTERED AS
OVISIONS OF THE NATIONAL INTERNAL

REVESLUE DISTRICT QFFICER (algnature st printed pame)

THIS CERTIFICATE MUST BE EXHIBITED Qm e | IE PLACE OF BUSINESS

EN



Reaferenca No : 4623000353347474
Dala Filad : Apni 13, 2023 02:16 PM
Balch Nurmber : 0

Republic of the Philippines

Department of Finance

fuaR  Bow
eaDuby: B Bureau of Internal Revenue

BIR Furm Ho. Annual Income Tax Return i

1702-RT Fo:'gq-awmpmu L) Rt;:.um Tex Rste |

&x
arumry 0THENCS) | e of roquind infarmetion i CAPITAL LETTERS. Mork spofiatén boeps wak s X
et Txs Copios MUST ba Bod with tho BIR and one he'd by fho lscpay=r el

1P Comnder  Faca [3AmendedFetzm? |6 St Podod Renmy | 5 Apnanumeric Tae Coda (ATC)
|cass Minimom Corporate Inceena Tax [MCIT]
1 Year Ended (NBL2IYY) Y No Yeu Mo

127022 L=

| Parti - Background frfonnation
Frarbquwmwmi [eer ™ -2t am .o |
3 Regittarme Noma (Cater oniy 1 efier por bor Laing CAPTTAL LETTERS)

LUXENBERG MARKETING, INC.

|9 Registered Adderas findicate complele mgisiernd eddmess)
2F 10 GOV PASCUAL AVE ACACIAMALABON CITY

98 Zecoda

19 Dats o IncorporanonDrpandaton (MIADOYYYY) 1

11 Caorflact Nursher 12 Email Addreea

2880850 benehta hexerberg Qo com

3 Memod of Dadocsons Mnm‘:gmtwu hmof‘hmm;emnumfc.sm 40% of Groes Icome [Sectian 2L,
L Part Il - Total Tax Peyable {Da NOT anter Cortaios) 1
114 Tozal tncom Taz Due (Overnayment] (From Pat iV Item 43) 1772528
15 Lesa: Total Taw CreditaPayments (From Part IV ftwmn 55) 7.704,130
16 Mvel Tax Paystle [(Overpayment] /tam 14 Lase Bam 18] (From Part [V ftem 58) 15.531.257)
|Add Panakiss

17 Surchargs o

18 iviereat 0

19 Compromine 0

20 Total Panakiss (Sum of Bems 17 Io 19) ]
21 TOTAL AMOUNT PAYABLE (Cvarpayment) (Som of Rur: 18 and 208 (8.301.260)

 Overpaymant. mark "X one bex anly (Once ¥is choce is mads, the s3me is iravocadie)
Ta be reunded To te tusued o Tax Crecl Cortificate (TCC) To be camiad cver as tax oredil raxt yeariouarier

== - 13 : T o T e ] |
bt Rewaum Cote ..._._:m“"::ﬁ“:.':‘;’m"‘"l_ﬂ..* e T el e
22 Number of
— — e L L Lo p—p—] AZachmants
el ST 1 Temof
Soratery P ™ I sgreion ™ 4
| Part U - Detals of Poyrment
l Particutars [ Nuraber Gale (LAWDEFYY Y] e
|23 CashvBark Dedit Mamo i °
[24 Check s
25 Tax Debst amo =
26 Others (Soacéy Asiow)
! I | | 2
VelastorRavonis ORGN Recoighs Detats (7 no! fiud asth an Actiatred Agera Banl) ﬁ“mm R e B

[RO's SigratumBaank Taller's intia)




:?6;'"_&"1- Annual income Tax Return

Januery 2018(ENCS) REGULAR Income Tax Rats
Page 2

Caorporation, Partnership and Other Nondndividual Taxpayer Subject Only to

e

1702-RT 011BENCS P2|

.?lxpayer identification Number ('I_‘IN) | F-!eglslered Name

e ———

007 -281 - 234 ~000 | [LUXENBERG MARKETING, INC.

P ——

Part IV - C of Tax

(Do NOT onfer Gerninvos)

IT7 SalesReceipta/Revenusc/Foes

340,773,007

28 Loes: Sales R and O

0

7% Nat Salsa/ReceiptaRavenues/Fees (fram 27 Lass fam 28)

340.773.037

30 Leos: Cont of Salos/Sorvicos

263,385.209

11 Groaa Incoma from Operation (fem 29 Lesa ltam J0)

77,387,738

12 Add: Other Taxable incoma Not Sublectod to Final Tax

]

331 Total Taxabls Income (Sum of famz 37 and J12)

77,387,738

Laan: Deductions Altownbia under Exiling Law

34 Ordinary Randzod Daductl (From Part V1
Schedule T Itemn 18)
b

70,296,020

35 Spedal Allowable nemized Deductiona (From Part VI i - —
Schedule 1T Item 5) = it

0

38 NOLGO (anly for those taxable undur Sec. 27(A 10 Gl
Sac. 28[A)(1) & (A)(G)(b] of Me Lax Code) (From Part VI
Schedule I Jtem 8)

37 Total Deductions (Sum of ifome 34 to 36) 70.266.028

OR [in caso foxable undar Soc 27(A) & Z8{ANT]]

18 Optional Standard Deduction (40% of Nem 33}

o]

I:D Nat Texabls Incomel/(lLosa) (#f Ramized: Nam 33 Lass Nam 37; If CSD: Ham 33 Less Ifem 38) I

7.091.712

|40 Anpcablo noome Tex Rate

| 25%

41 Inconva Tax Due other than Minimum Corporale Incomae Tax (MCIT) (flem 32 x fiorm 40)

1,772,928

42 MCIT Due (2% of ftem 33}

TTIBT7

43 Tax Dua (Normal Income Tax Due in Rem 47 OR e MCIT Oue in ilem 42, whichavsr iz higher)

(To Part If item 14)

__TT23828

ess: Tax Crecita/Payments (attach proal)

|24 Prior Year's Excesa Credits Other Than MCIT

5,066.711

45 Incoma Tax Paymant under MCIT from Pravious Ouarterfs

46 Incoma Tax Pay undar Reg 3 Rata from Previous Quartsrs

47 Ercuss MCIT Apped this Curment Taxabla Yoar (From Part VI Schedula IV ftem 4)

48 Craditable Tax Withheld from Previous Quarter/s por BIR Form Na, 2307

49 Craditable Tax Withheld per BIR Form No. 2307 for the 4th Quarter

B0 Foreign Tax Credits, if applicabls

Is1 Tox Paid in Retum Previouzly Filed, f thia Is an Amended Retum

52 Special Tax Crodits (To Port V Jtam 58)

Other Credila/Payments

Ise

e ]

le

56 Total Tax CroditePuyments (Sum of Ilems 44 to 54) (To Part 1T Itern 15)

7,704,150

58 Not Tax Peyabls / (Overpayment) (ifem 43 Less lism 55) ) (To Part 1 Item 16)

(9.831.262)

Part V - Tax Rellef Availment

57 Spediol Al L Ded (Mern 35 of Part IV x Applicabla Incoma Tax Ratn)

58 Add* Epadal Tax Credits (From Part IV Item 52)

o

{58 Total Tax Rellef Avellment (Sum of homs 57 and 58)




BIR Form No. ‘ ! T‘
1702-RT Annual Income Tax Return mlm ﬁl ‘
Ianuary 201B(ENCS) Corporation, Partnarship and Othar Non-individual Taxpayer Subject Only to i ‘ I
5 Page 3 REGULAR Income Tax Rate i ]
1702-RT D1MBENCS P3
Taxpayer Identification Number (TIN) Registered Name
oc7 - 281 - 234 - 000 . | LUXENBERG MARKETING, INC,
1 Schedule | - Ordinary Allowable liemized Deductions [Afiach additional sheels, S necessany) |
1 Amortizsbons T R e s i Sy S SRRt "D SR Tl A o
2 Bad Debls o
13 Charitable Contributions Q
4 Deplston 0
|5 Beprecaren 660,088
|6 Entertainment, Amussment and Recreation 134,293
7 Fringe Benefits 0
Interest a
Losses ]
10 Pension Trust 0
11 Rental 6,021,780
12 Research and Development ]
13 Salaries, Wages and Allowances 16,129,005
14 SSS, GSIS, Prihsalth, HOMF and Other Conlributions 1628117
15 Taxes and Licenses 1,407,250
16 Transportabon and Travel 3,324,700
17 Omers (Decuctons Subject to Wibholdng Tax and Other Expenses) [Specdy befon; Add eddtionsd
sheel(s), if necessary]
a Janitorizl and Messengerial Servicas 0
b Professional Fess 50.000
c Secunty Senices )
d MANPOWER SERVICES 37,515,631
le OTHER EXPENSES 3,024,152
i 0
g o]
n 0
1 0
&
M
|18 Total Ordinary Alicwabse ttamized Deductions (Sum of ltems 1 o 17) (To Part IV Item 34) | 70,295,025 |
~ Schedule i - Special Aliowable kemized Deductlons (Atach adaitional sheel/s, if necessary) ]
G Descrigtion Lega Besis Amount
1 2 [
2 -0
a 0
4 0

Total Special Allowable tamized Deductions (Sum of fems 1 (o 4) (To Part IV Item 35)




BIR Form No. 21
1702-RT Annual Income Tax Return ll mﬁm;ﬁl m
slarstiucy 20 SETHS) * e NBAULAR Incomss Tax Rt s 1702-RT 01/1BENCS P4
Page 4
Taxpayer identification Number (TIN) Registered Name
on7 ~ 281 =234 - 000 LUXENBERG MARKETING, INC.
[ Schedula M Computation of Net Operating Lons Carry Over (NOLCO) MBS e
1 Gross Income (Fm_m Part IV Jtem 33) a
2 Less. Ordinary Alowable ltefnized Deduclions (From Pet i Schedue | Zom 10} 0
0

3 Net Oparating Loss(Nem 1 Lass flem 2) (Ta Schedule IIIA, ltem 74)

hedule lILA - Computation of Avallable Net Operating Loss Carry Over (NOLCO) (DO NOT snler Contavos. €7 Cantavos o Lass aop ]

; 54 or more reund up)
S L R s} B) NOLCO Agpbod Previous Yeor
‘ Year incurred A) Amount
4 1] c
s 0 o
d 0 o
Iz 0 g
Continumtian of Schedula MA (Rem numbors continue from table sbove)
Loss (Unapphed
C)NOLCO Expired ) NOLCO Appled Current Yoar O D '
4 0 o o
5 0 o o
5 0 0 0
T 0 ] 0
8 Total NOLCO (Sum of hems 40 to 70] (To Part IV, 0
m 36)
[Schedule IV - Computation of Minimum Corporate lncome Tax (MCIT) |
I Year I A) Normal Income Tax as adjusied [ B} MCIT b RN ']
1 | [ o ]
2 [ 0
3 0 o 0
Contmustion of Scheduls IV (Ram numbers continue from Lable above)
|G) Balance of Excess MCIT Alowabie
D) Excess MCIT Applied/Used in F) Excess NCIT Applied this
Provious Yoers E) Expired Portion of Excass NCIT et Tk la Yaur an{:gt‘g:L’:‘nm~E-F}1m
1 0 [ 0
2 0 [ [
2 0 [ o
[

Totsl Excess MCIT Applied fmumof teme F 1o 3] (Ta Part IV lem 47)

| Scheduls V - Reconclilsfion of Nat incomae per Books Agsinst Texable income (alfach addilional sheet/s, # necessary) |

4 Net Income/{Loss) per books | 7.081.12
Acd: Non-deductble Expenses/Taxable Other income
2 e
3/ ]
(]
Total {Sum of Bama 1 1o 3) 7.081.712

Less: A) Non-Taxable Incoma and Income Subjeciad 1o Final Tex
hsl

@

B) Specisl Deductions

©




rer vorse wr e PHILIPPINEDS
DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE
BUREAU OF INTERNAL REVENUE
REVENUE REGIONAL OFFICE NO. 5 — CALOOCAN CTY

QF-TCC-01-01-2023.00

TCBP NO. 05-026-11-14-R1404-2023-M

TAX CLEARANCE CERTIFICATE

(Pursuant to Executive Ordar No. 398)

LUXENBERG MARKETING INC.

?’ *  Name of Taxpayer

ZIF #10 GOV PASCUAL AVE. ACACIA 1474 e
CI'I‘Y OF MALABON NCR TH]BD DISTRICT PHIL[PPINES

I _ Address 5
" 007-281-234-000

# Téxpayer.liientiﬁcaﬁdri Number

This is to certify that the above menhoned taxpayer is eligible for issuance of ﬂ1134Tax Clearance
Certificate having satisfied all the criteria set forth by the BIR as of the date of this cerhﬁcahon pursuant
to Revenue Reguiabons No 8—2016 as afnendnd ) : :

Tax liabilities recorded aﬂer the aforesald dates or outsuie the ]Ul‘lSdICth[l of th|s Ofﬁce are not covered
by this tax clearance. - ;
Issued this 14 day of November 2023

NOTE: THIS CERTIFICATE SHALL BE VALID AND EFFECTIVE FROM DATE OF ISSUE UNTIL NOVEMBER 14, 2024 ONLY OR UNTIL
REVOKED FOR VIOLATION OF THE CRITERIA SPECIFIED UNDER REVENUE REGULATIONS NO. 8-2016, AS AMENDED AND
REVENUE MEMORANDUM ORDER NO. 46 - 2018, WHICHEVER COMES EARLIER. THIS SHALL NOT BE USED ON
SALES/TRANSFER OF REAL PROPERTIES. CERTIFICATION FEE OF P100 WAS PAID ON NOVEMBER 14, 2023 UNDER EFPS
PAYMENT TRANSACTION NO. 237864531, ANY ERASURE MADE ON THIS TCC SHALL RENDER IT NULL AND VOID.

~=0.
LUISA M. LABAD
Asst. Chief, Collection Division

WARNING: Counterfeiting is punishable by law. For authenticity, please visit BIR website
www.bir.gpov.ph/index.php/tax-clearance/released-tax-clearance.html. Tax Clearance Certificate (for bidding

purposes) not listed/posted herein will be deemed to have originated from an illegal source.
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) REPUBLIC OF THE PHILIPPINES
' SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE COMMISSION
SEC Buiding. EDSA Greenhills
City of Mandaluyong Metro Manila

COMPANY REG. NO. (S200905443

)

vy

Ill'll.lll

CERTIFICATE OF FILING
OF
AMENDED ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION

&

i

0N

3: KNOW ALL PERSONS BY THESE PRESENTS:
=3
: This is to certify that the amended articles of incorporation of the

A
FXRIEILAY,
OCONANNONN

00000 ¥
/) (XL}

LUXENBERG MARKETING, INC.
{Amending Article I11 thereof.)

copy annesed, adopted on May 26, 201 by majority of the Beard of Directors and by the
vete of the stochholders owning or representing at least two-thirds of the outstanding
! capital stock, and certified under oath by the Corporate Secretary and a majority of the
Board of Directors of the corporation was approved by the Commission on this date
pursuant to the provision of Section 16 of the Corporation Code of the Philippines, Batas
Pambansa Blg. 68, approved on May 1, 1950, and copies thereof are filed with the
Commission,

el

ISR,

Unless this corporation obtains or already has obtained the appropriate Secondary
License from this Commission, this Certificate docs not authorize it to undertake

= business activities requiring a Secondary License from this Commission such as, but not
ot limited to acting as: broker or dealer in securities, government securitivs eligible desler
:E:E: {GSED), investment advicer of an  investment company, close-end or open-end
e investment company, investment house, transfer agent, commodity/financial fulures
S exchange/broher/merchant, financing company and time sharey/club shares/membership
s certificates issuers or selling agents thereof. Neither does this Certificate constitute as
e prrmit to undertake activities for which other government agencics require a license or
S permit.
=
e IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | have set my hand and caused the scal of this

Commission to affined to this Certificate at Mandaluvong City, Mctro Manila,

Philippines, this P day of June, Twenty Fourteen.
PRI,
SR e
o P o= ey E " T =
e e e D L FERDINAND B. SALES
oy, g Director
.‘: LA - A . = = =
e~ - Company Registration and Monitoring Department
SR e y
o
o s
= ¥
£ i } '
o i WL : b, A
s : i !
SR e S
i
- \I‘ql‘!‘l.l':':‘ ‘|.l. ’l‘l'i"" !.I‘l ‘l L "!".'l! '.Ill Foy L i
Caien O N s
50 s 'n'fd'u'o" e _ O S ST A ' 0




Standard Form Number: SF-GOOD-01
Revised on: May 24, 2004

APPROVED BUDGET FOR THE CONTRACT (ABC)

Project Name and Location

BAC Secretariat

Chairperson, BAC

0IC- Office of the University President

Stations: Mindoro State University
Length: Contract Duration:
OTHER COST FACTORS
OTHER e
CURRENT MARKET VAT, OTHER TAXES AND/OR | FREIGHT & | inDirecT [MNFLATION, CURRRENCY
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE TOTAL COST DUTIES APPLICABLE INSURANCE | cOSTS % | vALuE TOTAL COST UNIT COST
INFLATION, CURRRENCY
% VALUE
(11) (12) (13)
(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6) (7) (8) (9) (10) (5)X(9) | (10%I[(5)+(10)] | (11)/(3)
Lot 1- Office Equipment -
1 50" Smart TV with wall bracket 5 unit 49,000.00 245,000.00
4K (3,840x2,160) Resolution -
120Hz (Up to 144Hz) Refresh Rate -
HDR with Al Upscale -
with USB, HDMI and Ethernet Connectivity -
Lot 2- Other Supplies -
1 Pail 4 pcs 110,00 440.00
2 Dipper 5 pcs 35.00 175.00
3 All-purpose Cleaner 200m| 10 pack 350.00 3,500.00
4 Bleach 1 Gallon 6 bott;e 200.00 1,200.00
5 Soft-broom 12 pcs 150.00 1,800.00
6 Dust apn 10 pcs 90.00 900.00
7 Scrubbing Brush 3 pcs 70.00 210.00
8 Fabric Conditioner 670ml 3 bottle 150.00 450.00
HVXVHVXVRVRVAVXVAVIVIVXVAVEVAVAVAVXVIVX z |
= _~GRAND TOTAL 253,675.00 [NEA
Prepéred b Recom ing Approval Approved
QB
RENIELITOC, RICO NEMESIO H. D, LOS, Ph.D. CHRISTIAN ANTHONY C. AGUTAYA, Ph.D.
M Qm?

<1

Page 1of 1



Republic of the Philippines
MINDORO STATE UNIVERSITY
Main Campus
Alcate, Victoria, Oriental Mindoro =~ ®AcoNe Pitmnas

PURCHASE REQUEST
Fund Cluster: \STF
Office/Section : PR No.: 2024 - 005 Date:
CTE - BSED Responsibility Center Code : January 31, 2024
pmit.::;l No. | Unit item Description Qty Unit Cost Total Cost
LOT 1 - Office Equipment

1 Unit |50" Smart TV with wall bracket 5 49,000.00 245,000.00

-4K (3,840 x 2,160) Resolution =

-120Hz (Up to 144Hz) Refresh Rate -

-HDR with Al Upscale =

-with USB, HDMI and Ethernet Connectivity -

LOT 2 - Other Supplies X
2 Pcs |Pall 4 110.00 440.00
3 Pcs Dipper 5 35.00 175.00
4 Pack JAll-Purpose Cleaner 900ml. 10 350.00 3,500.00
5 Bottle |Bleach 1Gallon ' 6 200.00 1,200.00
6 Pcs |Soft -Broom 12 150.00 1,800.00
7 Pcs |Dust Pan 10 ) 90.00 900.00
8 Pcs §Scrubbing Brush 3 70.00 210.00
9 Bottle |Fabric Conditioner 670ml. 3 150.00 450.00

STE=107]1 _

03 tog :

£D 20 32| 001 d
TOTAL 253,675.00

Purpose:

Classroom Equipment and Other Suppiies for the College of Teacher Education, MinSU - Calapan City Campus

L : Certified:
Requested by Recommending Approvai: Allofinsnt Avaiable Approved by,

Signature : ol Jkin / JRVLNO Qo9
Printed Name : SHER‘E}‘\N C. BiCALDO ELVJC. ES £Z, Ph.D. rovEl P RO%MQM ANTHONY C. AGUTAYA, Ph.D.
Designation : CTE, Program Chair . us tive Director Buyiget Officer | OIC - Office of the University President

ALLUTIVIE IV AVAILABLE

CHARG EA%AGAWST Pagelof1l
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MACHERMIE'R. LANDICH
Acting Budget Offic
MinSCAT - Calapan
ok




Republic of' the Philippines
MINDORO STATE UNIVERSITY
Aleste, Vietorin, Oriental Mindoro

PROJECT PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT PLAN (PPME)
END-USER UNIT  Callege of Teacher Education - BSED
Charged to STF- Curricultim
Project, Programs nd Activilies

TOTAL MOLE OF SCHEDULE/ MILESTONE OF ACTIVITIES -
CODE GENER 5 ¢ : 2 : : .
blife ._W:U,EOZ I.ICZS. S AN AMOUNT | PROCUREMENT | Jan | Feb | Mar | Apr | May | Jun Jul | Aug | Sept | Oct | Nov | Dee
SEM | EXPENDABLES - OFFICE EQUIPMENT . 5 ==
. S nart TV 50" inch with Wall bracket | it 3 49,000.00 | 147,00000 | Public Bidding | i E 5
TOTAL _ 147,000,00 - 2]
TOTAL BUDGE1; 1:47,000.00
Prepared By: Recontmendiiiy Approval
~amiion TR
GLEY C. CASTILL() APR] . BAGON'FALLDAN, PhD
Propram Chair, BSED Dean, College of Teacher E:lucation




END-USER UNIT ' Callege of Teacher Education - BSED
Charged to §TF- Yacally
Prafect, Programs imd Aclivitics

Iepublic of the Philippines
MINDORO STATE UNIVERSITY
Aleate, Victoria, Oriental Mindoro

PROJECT PROCUREMENT MANAGEMVEENT PLAN (PPMP)

; ‘TOTAL MODE OF SCHEDULE/ MILESTONE 1)F ACTIVITIES
CODE D ISCRI TC o = : =1
GEIEMF DRSO i) QTY | UNITCOST| ,yoUNT | PROCUREMENT [“Jan | Tieb | Mar | Apr | May | Jun | Jul | Aug | Sept | Ot | Nov | Dco |
SEM! EXPENDABLES - OFFICE EQUIPMENT it | L =
* Smarl TV 50" inch with Wall bracket it 2 49,000.00 08,000.00 Public Bidding v e H
TOTAL 38,000.00 : i
TOTAL BUDGET" 98,000.00
Prepared By: _ Recommending Approval:
5 - /O
GLEN . CASTILLO APERIL M -FAVLDAN, PhD
Program Chair, BSED Dean, College of Teacher Education



END-USER UNIT - College of Teacher Bducation - BSED
Charged to STF- I'gcilities

Republic of (he Philippiies
MINDORO STATE UNIVERSITY

Alcale, Victorin, Oriental Mindoro

PROJECT PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT PLAN (PPME)

Project, Programs and Aclivities =
TOTAL MODE OF SCHEDULE/ MILESTONE OF ACTIVITIES
CODE GENERAL DESC : o =
A Filal Wb S UNITCOST| 4 \ioUNT | PROCUREMENT [ Jan | Teb | Mar | Apr _May | Jun | Jul | Aug | Sept | Qct | Nov | Deo |
OTHER SUPPLIES & MATERIALS EXPENSIZS e
+ |Pail s 4 110.00 440,00 Public Bidding | v ]
: Dipper pes 3 35,00 175.00|  Public Bidding v i &
* All-piirpose cleaner pos 10 350,00 3,500.00 Public Bidding v |
v Bleach O L G 200.00 1,200.00 Public Bidding v o
d Soft-broom pes 12 150.00 1,800.00 Pyblic Bidding v |
. Dust jyan ___pes 10 90.00 900,00 |  Public Bidding U i
. Brush pos 3 70,00 210.00 Public Bidding v oo ]
. Spin IMop pos 2 500,00 1,000.00 Public Bidding, v -
o Fabrin: conditioner pes 3 150,00 450,00 Public Bidding v
TOTAL = 9,675.00 ]
TOTAL BUDGET: 9,675.00
Prepared By: Recommendiig Approval:

e
GLEN , CASTILL()

Prograun Chair, BSED

Lk
APRI i = T DAN, PUD

Dean,

College of Teacher Eilucation




Main Campus

Republic of the Philippines
MINDORO STATE UNIVERSITY

Alcate, Victoria, Oriental Mindoro

BAGOMNG PILIPINAS

PURCHASE REQUEST
Fund Cluster: Nl
Office/Section : PR No.: 2024 - 005 Date:
CTE - BSED Responsibility Center Code : January 31, 2024
Pros;)?r(t:;(dNo. Unit item Description Qty Unit Cost Total Cost
LOT 1 - Office Equipment

1 Unit }50" Smart TV with wall bracket 5 49,000.00 245,000.00

-4K (3,840 x 2,160) Resolution -

-120Hz (Up to 144Hz) Refresh Rate -

-HDR with Al Upscale -

-with USB, HDMi and Ethernet Conneclivity -

LOT 2 - Other Supplies -
2 Pcs [Pail 4 110.00 440.00
3 Pcs iDipper S5 35.00 175.00
4 Pack jAll-Purpose Cleaner 900ml. 10 350.00 3,500.00
5 Bottle {Bieach 1Gallon 6 200.00 1,200.00
6 Pcs |Soft -Broom 12 150.00 1,800.00
7 Pcs |Dust Pan 10 90.00 900.00
8 Pcs §Scrubbing Brush 3 70.00 210.00
g Bottle jFabric Conditioner 670ml. 3 150.00 450.00

£bzo 32] 0¥ i
TOTAL 253,675.00

Purpose:

Classroom Equipment and Other Supplies for thé College of Teacher Education, MinSU - Calapan City Campus

Signature :

Reguested b){./ Recommending Approval: A]iotmceerﬂﬁiiabte Approved by;
% a
Skl oo fus Qo9

Printed Name :

SHERIDAN C. BICALDG

S
&= Ph.D

Campus cutive Director

ROVEWYN . RO%@rm ANTHONY . AGUTAYA, PhD.
Buglget Officer i OIC - Office of the University President

Designation : CTE, Program Chair
ARl A Page 1of 1
RGEABLE AGAINST agelo
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MACHLRM!E’R. LANDICH
Acting Budget Ofﬁcef’g

—ndl

MinSCAT - Calapan




